AGENDA
PRATTVILLE CITY COUNCIL
TUESDAY, APRIL 7, 2015
6:00 p.m.

A PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE AMERICAN FLAG:
INVOCATION:

ROLL CALL:

CALL TO ORDER:

THE CHARACTER TRAIT OF THE MONTH IS TRUTHFULNESS: Earning future
trust by accurately reporting past facts.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES: City Council Meeting March 17, 2015.
COMMENTS FROM PERSONS PRESENT REGARDING TONIGHT’S AGENDA:
MAYOR’S REPORT:
REPORT FROM COUNCIL ON SPECIAL COMMITTEES:
CONSENT AGENDA:

1. RESOLUTION: To Name Voting Delegate and Alternates for the Alabama League of
Municipalities’ Annual Convention in Tuscaloosa. (Sponsored By: Council President Wood)

2, RESOLUTION: To Set a Public Hearing to Grant Restaurant Retail Liquor License to
Alberto Munoz d/b/a The Boathouse Caribbean, LLC. (Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes)

3. RESOLUTION: To Set a Public Hearing to Declare Various Weeded Lots to be a Public
Nuisance and Ordering Their Abatement per Title 11, Chapter 67 of the Code of Alabama,
1975, as Amended. (Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes)

AGENDA

1. RESOLUTION: To Amend the Budget and to Authorize the Purchase of One (1) 2008
Chevrolet Impala from ADECA Surplus Property Division at a Cost of $11,500.00 for the
Police Department. (Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes)

2. RESOLUTION: To Amend the FY2015 Budget and to Release Funds to Faulkner Tile,
Inc. in an Amount not to Exceed $39,715.00 for the Repair of the Tile at Pratt Pool for the
Parks and Recreation Department. (Sponsored By: Councilor Boone)

3. RESOLUTION: To Award Bid No. 015-002 to J & M Displays for the July 4t Fireworks
Display Program at a Cost of $17,000.00. (Sponsored By: Councilor Boone)

4. RESOLUTION: To Release Funds for the Purchase of One (1) John Deere 997
Commercial Mower from Sunsouth, LLC or John Deere Company through NJPA Purchasing
Cooperative Contract #070313-DAC for the Public Works Department/Urban Management
Division at a Cost Not to Exceed $16,016.00. (Sponsored By: Councilor Boone)

5. ORDINANCE: To Surplus Two (2) Vehicles and Various Equipment from the Police
Department. (Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes)

6. ORDINANCE: To Surplus One (1) Vehicle and Fourteen (14) Eagle Traffic Signals from
the Engineering Department. (Sponsored By: Councilor Brown)

The next City Council meeting is scheduled for Tuesday, April 21, 2015 at 6:00 p.m.



7. ORDINANCE: To Surplus One (1) Vehicle and One (1) Tractor from the Public Works
Department/Wastewater Division. (Sponsored By: Council President Pro Tempore Striplin)

8. ORDINANCE: To Amend City of Prattville Code, Chapter 105 Buildings and Building
Regulations, Article 1 — In General, Section 105-24 Amendments. (Sponsored By: Councilor
Boles)

9. ORDINANCE: To Amend City of Prattville Code, Chapter 54, Article III — Special Events,
Section 54-96 Permit Applications; Fees, Subsection (D). (Sponsored By: Councilor Boone)

10. ORDINANCE: To Repeal Section 46-3 of City of Prattville Code, Chapter 46, Nuisances,
Article I - In General and to Adopt an Amended Weeded Lots Procedure and Establish an
Alternate Procedure for the Repeated Maintenance of Noxious and Overgrown Grass

and Weeds by the City. (Sponsored By: Councilor Boles)

11. ORDINANCE: An Ordinance Authorizing the Issuance and Making Provision for the
Payment of $12,280,000.00 General Obligation Refunding Warrants, Series 2015.
(Sponsored By: Council President Wood)

COMMENTS FROM PERSONS PRESENT:

CLOSING COMMENTS:

ADJOURN:



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

RESOLUTION

[To Name Voting Delegate and Alternates for the Alabama League of Municipalities’ Annual
Convention in Tuscaloosa. ]

{Sponsored By: Council President Wood}

WHEREAS, the Annual Convention of the Alabama League of Municipalities will
be held in Tuscaloosa, Alabama on May 16-19, 2015; and

WHEREAS, each member City is entitled to designate one voting delegate, and
first and second alternate voting delegates, to represent their City; and

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the City of Prattville to name its delegates to
ensure its voting participation at the Annual Convention Business Session which will be
held on May 18, 2015 at 3:45 p.m.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of

Prattville that the following are hereby elected as voting delegate and first and second

alternates:
Willie L. Wood, Jr. Voting Delegate
Denise Brown First Alternate
Second Alternate

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

RESOLUTION BOOK 2015, Page



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

RESOLUTION

[To Set a Public Hearing to Grant Restaurant Retail Liquor License to Alberto Munoz d/b/a
The Boathouse Caribbean, LLC.]

{Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes}

WHEREAS, the City of Prattville adopted Ordinance Book 97, Page 002, on
January 21, 1997, for the purpose of setting Public Hearings to allow public comment for
on-premises licenses, including Restaurant Retail Liquor License; and

WHEREAS, Alberto Munoz d/b/a The Boathouse Caribbean, LLC, located at 224
Interstate Commercial Park Loop, Prattville, Alabama 36066, has made application for
said license.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of
Prattville hereby sets a Public Hearing for April 21, 2015 at 6:00 p.m. in the Council
Chambers at City Hall for said license application.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

RESOLUTION BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

RESOLUTION

[To Set a Public Hearing to Declare Various Weeded Lots to be a Public Nuisance and

N

Ordering Their Abatement per Title 11, Chapter 67 of the Code of Alabama, 1975, as

Amended.]
{Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes}
WHEREAS, an abundance of overgrown grass or weeds:

is injurious to the public health, safety and general welfare by providing a breeding
ground and shelter for rats, mice, snakes and mosquitoes and other vermin;

may cause the further spread of weeds;

may hide debris, such as glass or metal, that could inflict injury on a person going to
such property; and

may also pose a fire hazard and respiratory hazard; and

WHEREAS, §11-67-1 et Seq., of the Code of Alabama, 1975 as amended, permits the

City Council of the City of Prattville to declare an abundance of overgrown grass and weeds to

be a public nuisance; and

WHEREAS, the Prattville Police Department Code Enforcement Officer has

inspected the properties at the following addresses and determined the existence of an

abundance of overgrown grass and weeds:

1142 East Main Street — Benny F. Hollon (19-05-15-2-001-003.000)

655 Thomas Avenue — Gerard & Sheila Jolivette (19-05-16-1-001-017.000)

433 Bedford Terrace — N.A. U.S. Bank Trust, 3701 Regent Boulevard Suite 200, Irving, TX 75063 (19-02-
03-4-003-016.000)

338 Bedford Terrace — Marguerite Duncan, 103 Heritage Hill Drive, Prattville, AL 36067 (19-02-10-1-
010-018-000)

347 North Chestnut Street — Ellen Faye & Rosetta Rogers, 3620 213" Place, Matteson, IL 60443 (19-03-
08-4-002-001.000)

230 Radburn Way — Jerry & Donna Cooper (19-02-10-1-009-002.000)

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that:

the City Council of the City of Prattville declares the abundance of overgrown grass and
weeds at the above listed addresses to be a public nuisance; and

the owners of said property, as they appear in the records of the Autauga County or
Elmore County Revenue Commissioners, are ordered to abate the abundance of
overgrown grass and weeds; and

the owners of said property are ordered to appear before the City Council of the City of
Prattville at a public hearing at 6:00 p.m. on May 5, 2015 in Prattville City Hall. Notice
of such hearing and a copy of this Resolution shall be sent by certified mail to owners
of said property.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council



AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

RESOLUTION BOOK 2015, Page



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

RESOLUTION

[To Amend the Budget and to Authorize the Purchase of One (1) 2008 Chevrolet Impala from
ADECA Surplus Property Division at a Cost of $11,500.00 for the Police Department.]

{Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes}

WHEREAS, the Prattville Police Department has a need for one (1) 2008 Chevrolet
Impala in their fleet; and

WHEREAS, said vehicle is available from ADECA Surplus Property Division at a cost
of $11,500.00.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of
Prattville that FY2015 Budget Line Item Gain/Loss Fixed Assets is hereby increased by
$3,644.00 and that FY2015 Budget Line Item Police Department/Capital Outlay is hereby
increased by $3,644.00.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that funds in the amount of $11,500.00 are hereby
authorized and approved to be paid to ADECA Surplus Property Division for the purchase of
one (1) 2008 Chevrolet Impala and said funds are approved and appropriated from FY2015
Budget Line Item Police Department/Capital Outlay.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

RESOLUTION BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

RESOLUTION
[To Amend the FY2015 Budget and to Release Funds to Faulkner Tile, Inc. in an Amount not
to Exceed $39,715.00 for the Repair of the Tile at Pratt Pool for the Parks and Recreation
Department. ]
{Sponsored By: Councilor Boone}

WHEREAS, the Prattville Parks and Recreation Department has a need to repair the
tile in Pratt Pool; and

WHEREAS, said repairs are available through Faulkner Tile, Inc. at a cost not to
exceed $39,715.00.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of
Prattville that the FY2015 General Fund Reserve is hereby decreased by $39,715.00 and that
FY2015 Budget Line Parks and Recreation/Capital Outlay is hereby increased by $39,715.00.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Prattville that said
funds in an amount not to exceed $39,715.00 are hereby authorized and approved to be paid
to Faulkner Tile, Inc. for the repair of the tile at Pratt Pool and said funds are approved and

appropriated from FY2015 Budget Line Item Parks and Recreation/Capital Outlay .

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

RESOLUTION BOOK 2015, Page

RESOLUTION



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

[To Award Bid No. 015-002 to J & M Displays for the July 4th Fireworks Display Program at a
Cost of $17,000.00.]

{Sponsored By: Councilor Boone}

WHEREAS, the City of Prattville sponsors the July 4th Fireworks Display Program
on an annual basis; and

WHEREAS, due to the cost of the event, the City of Prattville had a need to bid the
July 4th Fireworks Display Program; and

WHEREAS, five (5) bids were let for the Parks and Recreation Department
for the July 4, 2015 Fireworks Display Program; and

WHEREAS, two (2) sealed bid were received and J & M Displays was the lowest
responsible bidder with a cost of $17,000.00 for the event; and

WHEREAS, said 4th of July Fireworks Display Program is a budgeted expense of the
Parks and Recreation Department.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of
Prattville hereby awards Bid No. 015-002 in the amount of $17,000.00 to J & M Displays for
the July 4, 2015 Fireworks Display Program and said funds are approved and appropriated
from the FY2015 Budget Line Item Parks and Recreation/Independence Day
Parade/Fireworks.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

RESOLUTION BOOK 2015, PAGE

RESOLUTION



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

[To Release Funds for the Purchase of One (1) John Deere 997 Commercial Mower from
Sunsouth, LLC or John Deere Company through NJPA Purchasing Cooperative Contract
#070313-DAC for the Public Works Department/Urban Management Division
at a Cost Not to Exceed $16,016.00.]

{Sponsored By: Councilor Boone}

WHEREAS, there is a need for one (1) John Deere 997 Commercial L. C. Diesel Max-
Frame Z-Track Mower with 72-inch Side Discharge for the Public Works Department/Urban
Management Division; and

WHEREAS, said mower is available through NJPA Purchasing Cooperative
Contract #070313-DAC from Sunsouth, LLC or John Deere Company at a cost not to exceed
$16,016.00; and

WHEREAS, said mower is a budgeted expense for the Public Works Department/
Urban Management Division.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Prattville
that said funds in an amount not to exceed $16,016.00 are hereby authorized and approved to
be paid to Sunsouth, LLC or John Deere Company and said funds are approved and

appropriated from FY2015 Budget Line Item Urban Management Department/Capital Outlay.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

RESOLUTION BOOK 2015, PAGE

ORDINANCE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

[To Surplus Two (2) Vehicles and Various Equipment from the Police Department.]
{Sponsored By: Councilor Starnes}
BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Prattville, Alabama as
follows:
THAT the vehicles listed below and equipment listed in “Attachment A” are hereby

declared surplus of the Police Department and are to be removed from the inventory of said

department:
2001 Chevrolet Impala VIN: 2G1WF55K619269037 Dept. # 08-138
1998 Ford Crown Victoria VIN: 2FAFP71W6Wx131161 Dept. # 08-102

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that the City Council instructs the Mayor to sell
said vehicles and equipment on GovDeals.com and that proceeds be deposited into the
General Fund.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

ORDINANCE BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

ORDINANCE

[To Surplus One (1) Vehicle and Fourteen (14) Eagle Traffic Signals from the
Engineering Department.]

{Sponsored By: Councilor Brown}
BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Prattville, Alabama as
follows:
THAT the vehicle and traffic signals listed below are hereby declared surplus of the
Engineering Department and are to be removed from the inventory of said department:

2000 Ford F150  VIN: 1FTRX17W6YNA69292 Dept. # TR52
Eagle Traffic Signals Qty: Fourteen (14) Serial Numbers Unknown

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that the City Council instructs the Mayor to sell
said vehicle and traffic signals on GovDeals.com and that proceeds be deposited into the
General Fund.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

ORDINANCE BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

ORDINANCE

[To Surplus One (1) Vehicle and One (1) Tractor from the Public Works
Department/Wastewater Division. ]

{Sponsored By: Council President Pro Tempore Striplin}
BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Prattville, Alabama as
follows:
THAT the vehicle and tractor listed below are hereby declared surplus of the
Public Works Department/Wastewater Division and are to be removed from the inventory of
said department:

2000 Dodge Dakota VIN: 1B7GL22X6YS634683 Dept. # 11-100
1994 John Deere 6300 Tractor Serial No. L0O6300H134843

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that the City Council instructs the Mayor to sell
said vehicle and tractor on GovDeals.com and that proceeds be deposited into the
Wastewater Enterprise Fund.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

ORDINANCE BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

13

14

15
16

17
18

20

ORDINANCE

[To Amend City of Prattville Code, Chapter 105 Buildings and Building Regulations,
Article 1 - In General, Section 105-24 Amendments. ]

{Sponsored By: Councilor Boles}
BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Prattville that City Code,
Chapter 105 Buildings and Building Regulations, Article 1 — In General, Section 105-24
Amendments is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 105-24. - Amendments.

(@) The International Building Code, 2009 edition, as adopted in this article is amended as follows:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Prattville,
hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Section 101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement,
enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and
demolition of every building or structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or
structures.

Exceptions:

1. Detached one-and two-family dwellings, bed and breakfast operations, multiple single-family
dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of
egress and their accessory structures shall comply with the International Residential Code, 2009 edition.

2. Existing buildings undergoing repair, alterations or additions and change of occupancy shall be
permitted to comply with the International Existing Building Code, 2009 edition.

Section 101.2.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adopted.
Delete Section 103 Department of Building Safety.
Add Section 105.1.1 Annual permit.
Add Section 105.1.2 Annual permit records.
Delete Section 105.2, Building.
Item 2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829mm) high.

Item 5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons
(18,925 L) and the ratio of the height to the diameter does not exceed 2:1.

Item 12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than 54 inches
(1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support of Group R-3 and U occupancies.

Section 105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized
by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 after the time work has commenced. The building official
is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods of not more than 180 days each.

Exception: Demolition permits issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such
permit is commenced within 30 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is
suspended or abandoned for a period of 30 after the time work has commenced. The building official may grant,
in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods of not more than 30 days each.

Delete Section 109.3 Building permit valuations.
Section 113.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by

the building official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is hereby
created the Prattville Building Code Board of Appeals. The board shall consist of three (3) members appointed



=
RPOOWONOUT AWNE

e
BWN

i
o o

by the City Council of the City of Prattville and shall hold office at the pleasure of the council. Board members
shall be appointed for four years terms or until their replacements are duly appointed. Board members may be
reappointed at the conclusion of their term. The building official shall provide staff support and supplies for the
Board.

Add the following to Section 202, Definitions: BED AND BREAKFAST OPERATION—a private home,
inn or other unique residential facility located in a structure of historical significance defined as a structure
designated by the Historical Preservation Commission or a building located within the boundaries of the
historical district offering bed and breakfast accommodations and one (1) daily meal and having less than four
(4) guest rooms furnished for pay, with guest staying not more than fourteen (14) days, and where the innkeeper
resides on the premises or property, or immediately adjacent to it. Guest rooms shall be established and
maintained distinct and separate from the innkeeper's quarters.

Add the following sentences to end of Section 508.4 Separated Occupancies. All commercial tenant
spaces shall be separated by a minimum of 1 hour rated wall where the occupants are under one roof and have a
physical tenant separation with an individual address and utilities.

Add Appendices C, E, H and I.

Delete Appendices A, B, D, F, G, J, & K.

(b) The International Residential Code, 2009 edition, is amended as follows:

Section R101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Residential Code for One and Two-family
Dwellings of the City of Prattville, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section R101.2 Scope. The provisions of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment,
use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of detached one- and two-family dwellings, bed and
breakfast operations, townhouses not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a separate means
of egress and their accessory structures.

Exception: Live work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 of the International
Building Code shall be permitted to be built as one- and two-family dwellings or townhouses. Fire
suppression required by Section 419.5 of the International Building Code when constructed under the
International Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings shall conform to Section 903.3.1.3 of
the International Building Code.

Delete Section R103.
Delete Section 105.2, Building.
Item 2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high.

Item 4. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons
(18,925 L) and the ratio of the height to the diameter does not exceed 2:1.

Item 9. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than 54 inches
(1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.

Delete Section R108.
Section R112. Board of Appeals.

Appeals of orders, decisions and determinations made by the code official relative to the application and
interpretation of this code shall be made to the Building Code Board of Appeals established by Section 113 of
the Building Code of the City of Prattville.

Add the following to Section R202, Definitions: BED AND BREAKFAST OPERATION—a private
home, inn or other unique residential facility located in a structure of historical significance defined as a
structure designated by the Historical Preservation Commission or a building located within the boundaries of
the historical district, offering bed and breakfast accommodations and one (1) daily meal and having less than
four (4) guest rooms furnished for pay, with guest staying not more than fourteen (14) days, and where the
innkeeper resides on the premises or property, or immediately adjacent to it. Guest rooms shall be established
and maintained distinct and separate from the innkeeper's quarters.

R302.2 Townhouses. Each townhouse shall be considered a separate building and shall be separated by a
common 2-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263.



oo ~NoO oI~ WN -

Exception: A common 1-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119
or UL 263 and an approved sprinkler system in accordance with Chapter 9 of the International Fire Code,
2009 edition, is permitted for townhouses if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment,
ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides
and shall extend to and be tight against exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Electrical
installations shall be installed in accordance with Chapters 34 through 43. Penetrations of electrical outlet
boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4.

Delete Section R309.3.

Delete Section R313.

Section R314.5. Bed and Breakfast Operations. The fire alarm system for bed and breakfast operations
located in existing and historical buildings shall comply with the International Fire Code, 2009 edition, and be
monitored by an approved Fire Alarm Monitoring Service.

Delete Section R502.2.2.3. Deck lateral load connection.

Section N1103.2.1 Insulation. Supply ducts in attics shall be insulated to a minimum of R-6. Effective
July 1, 2013, supply ducts located in attic space shall be insulated to a minimum of R-8. All other ducts shall be
insulated to a minimum of R-6.

Section M1502.4.4.1 Specified length. The maximum length of the exhaust duct shall be 35 feet (10,668
mm) from the connection to the transition duct from the dryer to the outlet terminal. Where fittings are used, the
maximum length of the exhaust duct shall be reduced in accordance with Table M1502.4.4.1.

Add Appendix E, omitting Sections AE 302.2, AE 302.3 and AE 303.2.

Add Appendices G, H, J, and M.

Delete Appendices A—D, F, |, K, L, and N—Q.

(c) The International Existing Building Code, 2009 edition, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of the City of
Prattville, hereinafter referred to as “this code."

Delete Sections 103, 105, and 108.

Section 112. Board of Appeals.

Appeals of orders, decisions and determinations made by the code official relative to the application and
interpretation of this code shall be made to the Building Code Board of Appeals established by Section 1130f
the Building Code of the City of Prattville.

Add Appendix B.

(d) The International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 edition, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code of the City of
Prattville, hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Add Section 103.
Delete Sections 106, 107, 110, and 111.

Add Appendix A.
This Ordinance shall become effective upon its passage and execution as provided by

law.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

ORDINANCE BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

ORDINANCE

[To Amend City of Prattville Code, Chapter 54, Article III — Special Events, Section 54-96

Permit Applications; Fees, Subsection (D).]
{Sponsored By: Councilor Boone}

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Prattville that City Code,

Chapter 54, Article III — Special Events, Section 54-96 Permit Applications; Fees, Subsection

(d) is hereby amended to read as follows:

law.

Sec. 54-96 (d)

Special events requiring the assistance of the police department will require an additional
charge of $25.00 per officer, per hour, and is due no later than five days before the event.
Payment is to be made in the finance department. The City of Prattville, other governmental
entities, and any parade that has been established for 25 years or longer shall be exempt from
this requirement.

This Ordinance shall become effective upon its passage and execution as provided by

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson

City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.

Mayor

ORDINANCE BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

ORDINANCE

[To Repeal Section 46-3 of City of Prattville Code, Chapter 46, Nuisances, Article I - In
General and to Adopt an Amended Weeded Lots Procedure and Establish an Alternate
Procedure for the Repeated Maintenance of Noxious and Overgrown Grass
and Weeds by the City.]

{Sponsored By: Councilor Boles}

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Prattville that Section 46-3
of City of Prattville Code, Chapter 46, Nuisances, Article I. In General, is hereby
repealed.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Prattville
that Chapter 46, Nuisances, is amended as follows:

ARTICLE V. WEED CONTROL
Purpose of article.
In order to serve the public health, safety and welfare, the declared purpose of this article is to
prohibit and order the abatement of certain public nuisances within the city which are defined by this
article.

Definitions.
The following words, terms and phrases, when used in this article, shall have the meanings
ascribed to them in this section, except where the context clearly indicates a different meaning:

Excluded properties means those properties which are in a heavily wooded area, areas in their
natural state (i.e., not previously developed in any manner), property under current construction and
farm properties. A lot or premises of more than five acres, including subdivisions in which no lots
have been sold or occupied, shall be considered farm property and exempt from cutting or mowing;
except that each such designated farm property, when such property is not under cultivation for
useful purposes, shall be required to maintain an area of 50 feet from the abutting property lines of
abutting residential or business property, and 50 feet from the street front, which area shall be in
compliance with this article.

Owner or owners of property means the legal titleholder, lessee, occupant of property, agent of
the legal titleholder or lessee, person in charge, possession or control of such property.

Private property means real property owned by any individual, partnership, association,
syndicate, company, firm, trust, corporation, business or any entity recognized by law.

Public nuisance means any growth of weeds, wild bushes, grass or other vegetative growth which
exceeds 18 inches in height and which is injurious to the general public health, safety and welfare by
providing breeding grounds and shelter for rats, mice, snakes, mosquitoes and other vermin, insects
and pests; which obtains such heights and dryness so as to constitute serious fire threats or hazards;
which bear wingy or downy seeds, when mature, that cause the spread of weeds and, when
breathed, irritation to the throat, lungs and eyes of the public; which hides debris, such as broken
glass or metal, which could inflict injury on any person going upon the property; or which is unsightly.

Vacant lots means any area of land that either has no structure upon it or has an unoccupied
structure, whether that unoccupied structure is business or residential, upon the premises. A vacant
lot will encompass adjoining and/or included easements, ditches and alleyways.

Removal of Growth or Accumulation of Weeds, Rubbish, Etc.

(a) It shall be the duty of the owner, proprietor or person in charge or control of any premises to
keep the same, together with the adjacent sidewalk, clean and free from rubbish, waste and
offensive materials or substances; when such premises is not under cultivation for useful and
productive purposes, to keep the same free from weeds, brush or other vegetation growth.



O© oo NOOLh~ WN B

e ol
A WNRFRO

[EY
ol

R R e
m O ©Wom~N®

N NDNDDNDNDNDN
O NO Ol W

WWWWWWwWwWwwWwwWwN
OO NO Ol A~ WDNPEFE O

N
o

[Sa OIS NS ) B O S ol i
W NP OOWONO OO WNPE

(b)

It shall further be the duty of the owner, proprietor or person in charge or control of any
premises to cut or mow the weeds, brush and other vegetation growth and grass thereon to a
height of not more than 18 inches.

(c) A lot or premises of more than five acres, including subdivisions in which no lots have been sold

(d)

or occupied, shall be considered farm property and exempt from cutting or mowing; except that
each such designated farm property, when such property is not under cultivation for useful
purposes, shall be required to maintain an area of 50 feet from the abutting property lines of
abutting residential or business property, and 50 feet from the street front, which area shall be in
compliance with this article.

Whenever any such premises in the city is not being maintained in the condition required by this
article, such lot, place or premises may be declared to be a public nuisance and abated with the
provisions of the laws of the state and ordinances of the city. Private property in violation of this
article is a public nuisance and will be dealt with by the city pursuant to the provision of this
article and Code of Ala. 1975, § 11-67-60 et seq.

Notification and enforcement.

(a)

(b)

(c)

Nuisance declaration. All weeds, wild bushes, grass or other vegetable growth located upon the
streets, sidewalks or upon private property in the city which bear seeds of a wingy or downy
nature or which attain such growth of 18 inches or taller which becomes a fire menace when dry
or which are otherwise noxious or dangerous may be declared a public nuisance by the council
and, thereafter, abated as provided in this section.

Nuisance resolution. Whenever any such weeds are growing upon any street, sidewalk or private
property, the city council may, by resolution, declare the weeds to be a public nuisance and
order its abatement. Such resolution shall refer to the street by the name under which it is
commonly known, describe the property upon which or in front of which the nuisance exists by
giving a legal description thereto, and no other description of the property shall be required. Any
number of streets, sidewalks or parcels of private property may be included in one and the same
resolution.

Notice of hearing. After passage of such resolution, notice of a public hearing on the matter shall
be given by certified mail, return receipt requested, mailed 21 days prior to the date of the
hearing and shall inform the owner of the time, date and place of the hearing and the reason
therefor. The notice shall be mailed to the owner of the property as the property appears on
record in the tax assessor's office for the county. All notices shall carry a list of names of persons
and/or private contractors who perform such work and are registered with the city clerk. Such
names shall not constitute a recommendation, and the failure to include such a list shall in no
way affect the operation of this article. Notice shall also be given by publication in a newspaper
of general circulation published in the municipality once a week for two consecutive weeks. In
addition thereto, two signs shall be conspicuously posted on the property. The wording of such
signs shall not be less than one inch in height and shall be in substantially the following form:

NOTICE TO DESTROY WEEDS
Notice is hereby given that on the day of ,20  , at
a.m./p.m. in the council chambers, the council of the City of Prattville will consider a resolution
regarding the weeds growing upon or in front of the property on Street in the City

of Prattville and more particularly described in said resolution, a copy of which is on file in the
office of the city clerk; and at that time and place will determine whether the weeds constitute a
public nuisance which shall be abated by the removal of the noxious or dangerous weeds; and, if
so, will order the abatement and removal of the nuisance. If abatement and removal are
ordered, the cost of abatement and removal shall be assessed upon the lots and lands from
which or in front of which such weeds are removed, and the cost shall be added to the next
regular bills for taxes levied against the respective lots and lands for municipal purposes. The
costs shall be collected at the same time and in the same manner as ordinary municipal taxes are
collected. The costs shall be subject to the same councils and fees and the same procedure for
foreclosure and sale in case of delinquency as provided for ordinary municipal taxes.



© 0O ~N OO0l wWwNPE

N
= o

el
w N

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33

34

35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43

44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52

If no objections are filed with the city clerk at least five days before the meeting of the
council, and unless such person appears before the council in person or through his/her
representative to show cause, if any, why his/her objection should be sustained, it shall be
presumed that the person accepts the notice as fact and waives any rights he/she may have to
contest the removal of the weeds and the action of the council shall be final unless good and
sufficient cause can be otherwise shown.

Reference is hereby made to the resolution, on file in the office of the city clerk, for further
particulars.

Dated this day of , 20

City of Prattville, Alabama

City Clerk
The notice shall be posted at least seven days prior to the time for hearing objections by the city
council.
(d) Objections. If objections are filed at the time stated in the notice, the city council shall hear and

consider all evidence, objections and protests regarding the proposed removal of weeds. The
council may continue the hearing from time to time. Upon the conclusion of the hearing, the
council, by resolution, shall decide whether a public nuisance exists and, if so, shall order it to be
removed or abated with respect to any property or part of such property described. The council
by passage of such resolution shall be deemed to have acquired jurisdiction to proceed and
either to perform or have performed the work of removal or abatement with respect to such
property or part of such property. The decision of the council on the matter shall be deemed
final and conclusive.

(e) Abatement. After the council passes the resolution finding the conditions of the property to be a

nuisance and ordering its abatement, all employees and duly authorized agents of the city are
hereby expressly authorized to enter upon private property to abate the nuisance. The city
council may authorize private contractors, companies, corporations, enterprises or individuals to
abate and remove the nuisance. The council, by resolution, shall designate the contractors,
companies, corporations, enterprises or individuals who may perform the work. Those persons
so designated are hereby authorized to enter upon private property for purposes of abating or
removing the nuisance. For purposes of this article, compliance with the competitive bid law is
not required. Any property owner shall have the right to have such weeds removed at his own
expense providing that the removal is done prior to the commencing of the work by the
employees or agents of the city to remove such weeds.

Administrative procedures.

(a)

(b)

Report of Costs. The city shall keep an account of the costs of abating or removing the nuisance
in front of or on each separate lot or parcel of land where the work is done by it or its employees,
or by a duly authorized private contractor, company, corporation, enterprise or individual, and
shall render an itemized report in writing to the council showing the cost of removing the
nuisance on each separate lot, or in front of the lot. Before the report is submitted to the council,
a copy of the report shall be posted for at least five days prior thereto on or near the chamber
door of the council, together with a notice of the time when the report shall be submitted to the
council for confirmation.

At the time fixed for receiving and considering the report, the council shall hear the report,
together with any objections which may be raised by any of the property owners liable to be
assessed for the work of abating the nuisance and, thereupon, make such modifications in the
report as deemed necessary after which by resolution the report shall be confirmed. The
amounts of the cost for abating such nuisance in front of or upon the various parcels of land
mentioned in the report shall hereinafter be referred to as "weed liens" and shall constitute a
weed lien on the property for the amount of the weed liens, respectively. After confirmation of
the reports, a copy shall be given to the County Revenue Commissioner who, under the
“Optional Method of Taxation,” is charged with the collection of the city's municipal taxes



© 00 N ook~ wdNPE

[uny
o

Ol e e N N N el ol
OOWOW~NOoOU~WNRE

NDNDDNDNDDNDDNDDN
~NOo ol h WwWwN R

WWWWWWWWwN N
~NOoO OB WNPEFE O OO

w
o

39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48

49

50
51
52
53
54

(a)

(b)

(©)

pursuant to Article 1, Division 2, Chapter 51, of Title 11, Code of Alabama 1975, as amended. It
shall be the duty of the County Revenue Commissioner to add the amounts of the respective
weed liens to the next regular bills for taxes levied against the respective lots and parcels of land.
Thereafter, such amounts shall be collected at the same time and in the same manner as
ordinary municipal ad valorem taxes are collected and shall be subject to the same penalties and
the same procedure under foreclosure and sale in case of delinquency.

WEED CONTROL REPEAT OFFENDERS

Notification and Enforcement.

Pursuant to §11-67-68, Code of Alabama 1975, as amended, when a public nuisance exists that
was previously abated or on which abatement has been attempted through the process of
posting notice on the property in accordance with the provisions of Article | of this chapter, the
owner of the property on which the nuisance is located shall remove all weeds, wild bushes,
grass or other vegetative growth located upon the streets, sidewalks or upon private property in
the city which bears seeds of a wingy or downy nature, or which attain a growth height of 18
inches or taller, or which becomes a fire menace when dry, or which provide habitat to rats,
snakes or other disease vectors, or which are otherwise noxious or dangerous. The code
enforcement officer may declare the condition to be a reoccurring public nuisance, for the
purposes of abatement, and the code enforcement officer’s declaration shall be final.

When the code enforcement officer does so declare the reoccurring condition to be a nuisance,
the city may take such actions as are necessary to abate the nuisance without first adhering to
the procedures set out in §11-67-60 et seq., Code of Alabama 1975, as amended, including
without a resolution by the council declaring the condition to be a public nuisance, without
posting notice, without the council hearing objections, and without an order from the council for
abatement. All necessary employees of the city and its contractors and designees are expressly
authorized to enter upon such properties as are necessary to abate the nuisance.

Before the city may abate the nuisance, however, the code enforcement officer shall send the
owners of the property written notice by regular United States mail no less than ten (10) calendar
days before the city acts to abate the nuisance. The notice shall (1) inform the owners that the code
enforcement officer has declared the property present a nuisance; (2) inform the owners that the
city has previously abated such a nuisance, or it has attempted to abate such a nuisance, on the
property; and (3) inform the owners that the reasonable costs of the abatement shall be assessed
and collected as a special assessment and lien against the property; (4) inform the owners that they
may have any nuisance removed at their own expense prior to the arrival of the employees,
contractors, or designees assigned by the city to abate the nuisance; and (5) inform the owners that
no further notices will be sent by the City for the remainder of the growing season.

Administrative procedures.

(@)

(b)

When properties that have required repeated maintenance of noxious and overgrown grass and
weeds are abated by the city, as set forth in this article, city shall keep an account of the costs of
abating or removing the nuisance in front of or on each separate lot or parcel of land where the
work is done by it or its employees, or by a duly authorized private contractor, company,
corporation, enterprise or individual, and shall render an itemized report in writing to the council
showing the cost of removing the nuisance on each separate lot, or in front of the lot. Before the
report is submitted to the council, a copy of the report shall be posted for at least five days prior
thereto on or near the chamber door of the council, together with a notice of the time when the
report shall be submitted to the council for confirmation.

At the time fixed for receiving and considering the report, the council shall hear the report,
together with any objections which may be raised by any of the property owners liable to be
assessed for the work of abating the nuisance and, thereupon, make such modifications in the
report as deemed necessary after which by resolution the report shall be confirmed. The
amounts of the cost for abating such nuisance in front of or upon the various parcels of land



O© 00O NO Ol WwN K-

e e L < e =
o M W DN B O

QOO oo oS Pr,EDRPRDEAEEEREAEDDOWWWWWWWWWNDNNDNNMNMNNNDNDNDNDEERPRE
~NO O WNPFPOOONOOITRARWNPFPOOONOUIARWNPFPOOONOUIRRWNPEFEOOOW-N

mentioned in the report shall hereinafter be referred to as "weed liens" and shall constitute a
weed lien on the property for the amount of the weed liens, respectively. After confirmation of
the reports, a copy shall be given to the County Revenue Commissioner who, under the
“Optional Method of Taxation,” is charged with the collection of the city's municipal taxes
pursuant to Article 1, Division 2, Chapter 51, of Title 11, Code of Ala. 1975, as amended. It shall
be the duty of the County Revenue Commissioner to add the amounts of the respective weed
liens to the next regular bills for taxes levied against the respective lots and parcels of land.
Thereafter, such amounts shall be collected at the same time and in the same manner as
ordinary municipal ad valorem taxes are collected and shall be subject to the same penalties and
the same procedure under foreclosure and sale in case of delinquency.

Each of the provisions of this ordinance are severable; and if any provision shall be
declared to be invalid, the remaining provisions shall not be affected but shall remain in
full force and effect.

All ordinances or parts of ordinances, in any manner conflicting here with are
hereby repealed.

This Ordinance shall become effective upon its passage and execution as provided by
law.

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 7t DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

ORDINANCE BOOK 2015, PAGE



O©oo~NOoOOIThWN PR

ORDINANCE
[An Ordinance Authorizing the Issuance and Making Provision for the Payment of
$12,280,000.00 General Obligation Refunding Warrants, Series 2015.]
{Sponsored By: Council President Wood}

PREPARED BY BOND ATTORNEY

ADOPTED THIS 7th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Willie L. Wood, Jr., President
Prattville City Council

AUTHENTICATED THIS 77th DAY OF APRIL, 2015.

By: Cathy Dickerson
City Clerk

APPROVED:

By: Bill Gillespie, Jr.
Mayor

ORDINANCE BOOK 2015, PAGE



